
PUBLIC WORK REQUIREMENTS 
 
A. Payment of Prevailing Wages: Contractor and any subcontractor(s) performing any Public Work shall 
comply with the provisions of Sacramento City Code section 3.60.040  and applicable provisions of the 
California Labor Code, which require, among other things, that Contractor and all subcontractors pay not 
less than the prevailing rate of wages, as determined by the Director of the California Department of 
Industrial Relations (“DIR”) in accordance with California Labor Code section 1773.  Contractor and every 
subcontractor shall maintain payroll records and submit certified payrolls and other labor compliance 
documentation electronically when and as required by CITY. In addition, Labor Code Section 1771.4 
requires the Contractor and any subcontractor performing any Public Work to furnish electronic payroll 
records directly to the Labor Commissioner. Contractor shall include these requirements in every 
subcontract.   
 
This Agreement is subject to compliance monitoring and enforcement by the DIR, as specified in California 
Labor Code section 1771.4. The Contractor and any subcontractor will be subject to withholding and 
penalties for violation of prevailing wage requirements in accordance with applicable law, including Labor 
Code Sections 1726, 1741, 1771.5, and 1775, and City Code Section 3.60.040. Questions regarding the 
City’s Labor Compliance Program should be directed to the City Representative.  
 
B. DIR Registration: California Labor Code Section 1725.5 requires the Contractor and all subcontractors 
performing Public Works services to be currently registered with the DIR, as specified in California Labor 
Code Section 1725.5. California Labor Code Section 1771.1 provides that a contractor or subcontractor 
shall not be qualified to bid on, be listed in a bid proposal (subject to the requirements of Section 4104 of 
the California Public Contract Code), or engage in the performance of any contract for Public Work, unless 
currently registered and qualified to perform Public Work in accordance with California Labor Code 
Section 1725.5.  
 
Further information can be found on DIR’s website at http://www.dir.ca.gov/Public-
Works/Contractors.html.  The above summary is provided solely for informational purposes and does not 
in any way affect the Contractor’s and subcontractors’ obligation to comply in all respects with all other 
applicable laws and regulations. The Contractor shall disseminate these provisions to all subcontractors. 
 
Before the performance of work by Contractor or any subcontractor(s) under this Contract, Contractor 
shall furnish Contractor’s and any subcontractors’ current DIR registration number(s). The Contractor’s 
current DIR registration number and the current DIR registration number of all subcontractors will be 
listed on the Subcontractor and LBE Participation Verification Form, incorporated herein. 
   
C. Workers’ Compensation Certification. In accordance with California Labor Code Section 1861, by signing 
this Contract, Contractor acknowledges and represents that Contractor is aware of the provisions of 
section 3700 of the California Labor Code which requires every employer to be insured against liability for 
workers' compensation or to undertake self-insurance in accordance with the provisions of that code, and 
that Contractor will comply with the provisions of the Labor Code before commencing performance  under 
this Contract. 
 
D. Apprentices. If this Contract is for the performance of any Public Work, and the amount of the Contract 
is $30,000 or more, the Contractor and any subcontractors performing any Public Work under this 
Contract must comply with and be subject to enforcement under, the provisions of Sacramento City Code 



Section 3.60.050, Section 1777.5 et seq. of the California Labor Code, and implementing regulations set 
forth in Title 8 of the California Code of Regulations, governing the employment of apprentices. The 
Contractor and any subcontractors performing Public Work will be subject to penalties for apprenticeship 
violations in accordance with Labor Code Section 1777.7. 
 
E. Working Hours. If this Contract is for the performance of any Public Work, Contractor and any 
subcontractors performing any Public Work under this Contract must comply with and be subject to 
enforcement under, the provisions of Sacramento City Code Section 3.60.040 and California Labor Code 
Section 1810 et seq., governing the working hours of employees performing Public Work. 
 
F. Failure to Comply with Labor Compliance. If all applicable labor compliance requirements are not met, 
the City will have the right to withhold or reject a payment request and/or invoice, in whole or in part, 
without in any way relieving Contractor or its subcontractors of any obligations under this Contract. 
 
G. Subcontractors. The Contractor shall include these provisions A through F in every subcontract or sub-
agreement for any subcontractors performing work under this Contract. 
 


